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FTC Announces FinTech Forum on Crowdfunding, 
Peer-to-Peer Payments 
By Obrea O. Poindexter, Trevor R. Salter, and Amanda J. Mollo 

On August 3, 2016, the Federal Trade Commission (FTC) released two items in connection with its series of 
events on the implications of FinTech for consumers. First, the FTC announced it will be hosting the next event in 
the FinTech Forum series on October 26, 2016. The event will address crowdfunding and peer-to-peer payments. 
Second, the FTC posted some key takeaways on its Business Blog from the first event in this FinTech Forum 
series, held on June 9, 2016, which addressed marketplace lending.  

The FTC’s announcement regarding the October 2016 FinTech Forum describes the event as being “designed to 
bring together perspectives from across the landscape”—specifically, the perspectives of industry participants, 
consumer groups, researchers, and government representatives. The half-day forum will include separate panels 
exploring the “growing sectors” of crowdfunding and peer-to-peer payments individually, including the different 
models of crowdfunding and peer-to-peer payments that FinTech companies may employ, as well as the potential 
benefits and drawbacks of these models for consumers. Just as the FTC did in its forum on marketplace lending, 
the forum on crowdfunding and peer-to-peer payments will address the applicability of existing consumer 
protection laws, particularly the FTC Act’s prohibition on unfair or deceptive acts or practices (UDAP).  

Like the upcoming event in October, the June 9, 2016 FTC forum on marketplace lending brought together 
panelists who could provide different perspectives on marketplace lending, including researchers, industry 
participants, government representatives, and consumer advocates. The panelists discussed different models of 
marketplace lending and the opportunities new technologies present to expand access to consumer credit. In 
addition, panel discussions focused on potential consumer protection issues associated with marketplace lending 
and how regulators can work to meet these challenges.   

The FTC’s Business Blog post reinforced a key theme from the marketplace lending forum in discussing how 
current laws apply to marketplace lending. Specifically, the blog post noted that the FTC Act, the Truth in Lending 
Act, the Electronic Fund Transfer Act, the Fair Credit Reporting Act, the Gramm-Leach-Bliley Act, the Equal Credit 
Opportunity Act, and the Fair Debt Collection Practices Act “govern market activities from loan disclosures to 
credit reporting to privacy practices to debt collection.” Perhaps owing to the limited enforcement authority of the 
FTC with respect to consumer financial laws, the FTC emphasized its UDAP authority over non-banks, 
particularly in how consumer data is used and shared. Non-bank marketplace lenders and other FinTech 
companies should be aware not just of the restrictions and requirements in these existing laws, but also of the 
FTC’s continued engagement in policing non-banks that provide consumer financial services. 
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About Morrison & Foerster: 

We are Morrison & Foerster—a global firm of exceptional credentials. Our clients include some of the largest 
financial institutions, investment banks, Fortune 100, technology and life science companies. We’ve been 
included on The American Lawyer’s A-List for 13 straight years, and Fortune named us one of the “100 Best 
Companies to Work For.” Our lawyers are committed to achieving innovative and business-minded results for our 
clients, while preserving the differences that make us stronger. This is MoFo. Visit us at www.mofo.com. 

Because of the generality of this update, the information provided herein may not be applicable in all situations 
and should not be acted upon without specific legal advice based on particular situations. Prior results do not 
guarantee a similar outcome. 
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